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JEWELRY.
Each piece signed L'Atelier Plume is designed in Nantes and made by
several hands in Jaipur. Over there, everything calls for creation: the
people, the landscapes, the flow, the colors...

It is from this mix of cultures that L'Atelier Plume 
draws all its substance from this mix of cultures. From her love of stones to
the special relationship she has developed with talented Indians, Claire
continues her story today, creating new grigris each season that we want to
collect ad infinitum.

The collections are made up of jewelry in brass, 925 silver and 9K gold...
and always adorned with fine and/or precious stones. Her collections
consist mainly of bracelets, the star piece of her jewelry box, but also
necklaces, rings, BO and other desirable marvels...

READY-TO-WEAR.
Textile craftsmanship in India is an integral part of the country's traditional
culture. There are still many artisans today, often grouped into
cooperatives, who maintain the traditional techniques of fabric manufacture
and decoration. 
 
After falling in love with all the magnificent sarees, kanthas, Khadi cotton
and other Indian textile arts, it was only natural that Claire should try her
hand at ready-to-wear.
 
Today, Atelier Plume boasts masterpieces in its dressing room, such as the
Kali jacket, the Mija dress and the Geeta shirt... 

L’Atelier
Plume.





A lover of pretty things, Claire grew up in a family steeped in culture. The
daughter of a sound engineer and a porcelain painter, art in all its forms has
shaped her outlook over the years. After starting out in graphic design,
Claire became a cultural communications manager and spent more than 10
years touring theaters...

Then, with the birth of her daughter Marnie, Claire decided to follow a new
desire and began making jewelry. This new artistic impulse was quickly
spotted, and she became a columnist, proposing a weekly selection of
trendy and slightly rock DIYs.

Enriched by this experience, she decided to source new wonders, including
the fine stones she has always loved. Her research led her to meet her
historic workshop in India. Atelier Plume was born in 2015.

Since then, this purveyor of grigris has seduced a number of pretty names
over the seasons, with whom she has created capsules... she has worked
with Des Petits Hauts, Mathilde Cabanas, Alysson Paradis, Jamini and
Bonton.

Claire.





High-
fantasy
collection.

Immerse yourself in a world of elegant grigris with our brand-new costume
jewelry collection, an enchanting fusion of Indian inspirations and
sumptuous gemstones. Each piece embodies the very essence of grace and
elegance, capturing the richness of the warm, suave hues that characterize
this unique range.

This collection invites you to explore India's rich heritage through a
modern, artistic prism. Iconic pieces from our repertoire have been re-
edited with a contemporary twist, preserving the timeless soul while
infusing new life. In addition, we are proud to present a series of never-
before-seen creations that complement this collection, creating an
immersive and dazzling jewelry experience.

Fine stones such as jasper, quartz and labradorite come to life in hues that
evoke fiery skies and golden deserts. Each jewel tells a story of mystery
and magic, thanks to the subtle sparkle of these carefully selected gems.
These stones are not just an ornament, but also a way to connect with
positive, ancient energies.













gold
jewelry
collection.

Welcome to the refined and captivating world of our brand-new 9K gold
jewelry collection. Each piece in this collection embodies the perfect
balance between bold originality and elegant tradition, creating an
experience of timeless luxury. 9K gold, with its warm glow and exceptional
durability, is the perfect backdrop for these exquisite creations. 

Each jewel has been meticulously crafted to capture the essence of
sophistication, skillfully fusing contemporary elements with classic details
that have stood the test of time. Fine and precious stones, carefully
selected for their brilliance and significance, add a touch of magnificence
to each piece. 

From the hypnotic sparkle of diamonds to the mysterious depth of emeralds
and sapphires, each gem tells a story of rarity and elegance. These
precious stones, inlaid in gold with masterful craftsmanship, illuminate each
jewel with a special aura. 

This collection is a celebration of the duality between originality and
tradition. Contemporary lines and avant-garde designs harmonize with
classic elements, such as delicate floral motifs and intricate details. 

Each piece of jewelry is a work of art in itself, capable of adapting to both
current trends and timeless tastes. Whether you're looking for a stunning
centerpiece for an elegant evening, or want to add a touch of luxury to
your everyday life, our collection offers a variety of choices to suit every
style and occasion.











Ready-to-
wear
collection.

Immerse yourself in the enchanting world of our brand-new clothing
collection, where casual bohemian charm meets bold, assertive style. Each
piece in this collection embodies freedom of expression, deftly fusing
casual comfort with natural elegance, creating a fashion experience that
exudes confidence and originality. Our collection is distinguished by
signature pieces that draw from the classic women's dressing room, while
breathing new life through artisanal details and authentic materials. Hand-
woven cotton is the canvas on which our story of creativity and
craftsmanship is drawn. 

Each garment is the fruit of a meticulous process, where traditional
craftsmanship meets modern design. Vibrant colors and ample shapes
characterize our collection, offering unparalleled comfort without
compromising on style. Whether it's a flowing dress in rich hues that dances
in the breeze or loose pants that exude freedom, each piece has been
designed to embrace your individuality and showcase your confidence. 

Casual bohemian style is boldly asserted in every couture, but always with
a touch of sophistication. Captivating patterns and unique cuts let you
express your personality with panache, while meticulous finishes reflect
attention to every detail. Whether you're looking for an outfit for a casual
day on the town or want to shine at a special event, our collection offers a
diverse range for every occasion. Each garment is an invitation to embrace
life with lightness, while remaining true to your distinctive style.


























